
exiting
emergency evacuation, CLOSE your 
door but do not lock it.  This will help 
prevent damage to your room and slow 
the spread of smoke and fire. 

�‰ Evacuation. Follow  more detailed 
directions as outlined in the Safety 
Check Brochures titled ‘Emergency 
Evacuation Procedures’ and 
‘Evacuation Assistant Guide’ 

�‰ Fire Doors.  Never wedge open fire 
doors.  All stairwell doors and most 
corridor doors are 'fire rated' doors.  
Such doors are designed to protect exits 
from smoke and fire for up to two 
hours.   

General housekeeping  

�‰ Storage of Combustibles. All stored 
items must be kept neat and orderly and 
not allowed to accumulate in excessive 
amounts.  Items stored must be kept at 
least 2 feet from ceiling (or 18 inches 
from sprinklered ceilings) and at least 3 

feet from any heat source (such as 
heaters, light fixtures, appliances, etc).   

�‰ Dryer Lint .  Dryers and other laundry 
machines must be kept free of lint.  
Empty lint traps between loads.  Keep 
the area around the machines clean. 

Cooking




